
98%
OF OUR 
TEABAGS ARE
biodegradable

ALL
INNER
CARTONS 
ARE
biodegradable

ALL
OUTER
CARTONS 

ARE
biodegradable

ALL
PRODUCTS
ARE
ETHICAL &
CARBON
NEUTRAL

PRODUCT RANGE FORMAT ENVELOPE TEA BAG FOIL POUCH OVER-WRAP

PREMIUM TEA  
SELECTION

PAPER 
ENVELOPES

biodegradable recyclable 
biodegradable by 2020

recyclable 
biodegradable by 2021

FOIL 
ENVELOPES

recyclable 
biodegradable by 2021

recyclable 
biodegradable by 2021

STRING & TAG recyclable 
biodegradable by 2021

recyclable 
biodegradable by 2021

TAGLESS recyclable 
biodegradable by 2020

LOOSE TEA recyclable 
biodegradable by 2020

GOURMET TEA  
SELECTION

GREEN TEA SELECTION

ENVELOPES recyclable 
biodegradable by 2021

biodegradable recyclable 
biodegradable by 2021

STRING & TAG recyclable
biodegradable by 2021 

recyclable 
biodegradable by 2020

recyclable 
biodegradable by 2021

LOOSE TEA recyclable 
biodegradable by 2020

FUN TEA SELECTION

HERBAL INFUSIONS

ORGANIC TEA  
SELECTION

ENVELOPES recyclable 
biodegradable by 2021

recyclable 
biodegradable by 2021

recyclable 
biodegradable by 2021

STRING & TAG recyclable 
biodegradable by 2021

recyclable 
biodegradable by 2020

recyclable 
biodegradable by 2021

LOOSE TEA recyclable 
biodegradable by 2020

EXCEPTIONAL TEA  
SELECTION

SILVER JUBILEE  
GOURMET

t-SERIES

VIVID TEA SELECTION

ENVELOPES recyclable 
biodegradable by 2021

biodegradable recyclable 
biodegradable by 2020

STRING & TAG biodegradable recyclable 
biodegradable by 2020

recyclable 
biodegradable by 2021

LOOSE TEA recyclable 
biodegradable by 2020

SUSTAINABLE PACKAGING
FACT SHEET

THE COMPANY IS CERTIFIED IN COMPLIANCE WITH

ISO 9001: 2015 
Quality Management  
System Standard

FSSC 22000 
Certification scheme for food Safety 
Systems including ISO 22000, 
ISO/TS 22002-1 and FSSC 22000 
requirements for certification

BRC 
Global Standard 
for Food Safety

ISO 14001:2015 
Environmental Management 
System Standard 

For more information on our 
sustainability initiatives visit
dilmahtea.com/sustainability/

ALL
TIN 

CADDIES 
ARE

recyclable

Sedex 
Members 
Ethical 
Trade Audit 
(SMETA)


